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Abstract

There are many strategies for estimating the effectiveness of instruction. Typically, most
methods are based on the student evaluation. Recently a more standardized approach, Quality
Matters (QM), has been developed that uses an objectives-based strategy. QM, however,
does not account for the learning process, nor for the value and worth of the learning
experience. Learning is a complex and individualized process that course designers and
instructors can capitalize on to increase the value and subsequent worth of a course for all
stakeholders. This article explores the concepts of value, worth, and quality of online
education, seeking a method to improve outcomes by increasing a course’s value and worth.

Introduction

The number of students taking online and distance education courses has exploded over the
past decade. Currently, online course offerings provide 32% of total enrollment in degree-
granting post-secondary institutions, while online-only students represent 49.9% of all new
college enrollments (Allen & Seaman, 2013). With this explosion of online instruction,
colleges and universities are committed to improving the design and delivery of their online
instruction. However, this is a difficult task because the many factors that make a course
successful can be elusive (Smyth, 2014). The success of a course is dependent on a
confluence of key elements such as structure, content, tasks, instructional strategies, and
learner consideration (Koohang, 2004). The online course must then be successfully
deployed and delivered to students. 

The concept of quality in online learning, which provides both a means of accountability and
a route to improvement, is as complex as online learning itself (Smyth, 2014). One approach
intended to improve online instruction has been the Quality Matters (QM) movement. While
useful in designing objectives-based online courses, however, standardized methods do not
account for the learning process (Swan, et al., 2012), nor for the value and worth of the
learning experience itself. The process for determining the worth and value of an online
course can be done but is complex and multidimensional. 

Courses, online or face-to-face, do not exist in a vacuum. In most institutions, there are four
primary stakeholders, each with a vested interest in the success or failure of the instruction:
administrators, instructional designers, faculty, and students. Administrators provide the
central resources to develop and deliver a course. Instructional designers create the course
using accepted techniques and tools, together with content provided by subject-matter
experts. Faculty also serve as subject matter experts and specialize in the delivery of the
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education to students, the consumers of instruction. This makes each course
multidimensional as each stakeholder group sees it from a different perspective for a
different purpose (Harvey & Green, 1993; Tam, 2001). Consequently, it is a difficult task to
create successful, quality instruction. 

Today’s course designers have at their disposal sophisticated technologies to design and
deliver a truly remarkable learning experience. However, as Churches points out, it’s not just
about the tools; “it’s about using the tools to facilitate learning” (2008). Education
technologies continue to evolve and improve, yet online instructional design remains
inconsistent and varied between institutes.

Value

Determining the “value” of an online course is an individual decision that varies depending
on the stakeholder. At their core, all courses are valuable to students in degree programs for
the credits earned through completion. Many courses are popular, not based on being of high-
or low-quality, but because the subject matter is interesting or required to complete a
program of study. Consider that a low-quality course can have high value simply because the
course is required for the program of study. Conversely, even the highest-quality course will
hold no value for a student with no reason to take it. Online availability in itself can provide
value to a student or instructor facing a long commute to campus, again, regardless of
“quality.” Similarly, asynchronous online availability can be highly valuable to a student
with time obligations that conflict with a more traditional class schedule. Instructional
designers have many options available to help students build an increased sense of value.
Keller’s ARCS Model of Motivational Design is a proven tool to help accomplish this
complex task (Kuan-Chung & Syh-Jong, 2010). The model is based on the expectancy-value
theory of Tolman and Lewin which states people are motivated to participate in activities that
fulfill personal needs and from which they have a reasonable chance of successful
completion (Keller, 1987b). 

Worth 

The “value” of a course is more subjective to the audience perception of “worth.” Value
causes the student to enroll in the course but “worth” determines the effort they put forth to
be successful in the course: the greater the value, the higher the worth. For example, an Art
History course may be extremely worthwhile to an Art major, regardless of its “quality.”
They may learn new knowledge critical to their future courses and careers, and therefore will
sustain their effort in assignments and assessments. In contrast, the only worth an Art History
course may hold for a Business major is the fulfillment of a Humanities requirement for their
degree program. That Business major has little motivation to excel in such a course, and may
exert only minimal effort required to “pass” the class to fulfill the degree and credit
requirements. Yet even an undeclared major may find great worth in an Art History course if
the course design stimulates their interest. 

Motivation accounts for between 16% and 38% variance in student achievement (Means,
1997). Keller’s ARCS Model of Motivational Design provides a proven strategy to account
for learning differences by focusing on attention, relevance, confidence, and satisfaction
(Keller, 1987a, 1987b, 2010; Hodges, 2004). He defines motivational design as “the process
of arranging resources and procedures to bring about change in motivation” (Keller, 2006).
Open-ended course design that allows for flexibility in course resources and presentation can
help address some of the factors that play a role in predetermining effective student learning
and allow students to develop a deeper sense of value about a course. High attrition rates can
be directly attributed to low motivation (Kuan-Chung & Syh-Jong, 2010); therefore, it is vital
that instructional designers understand principles of motivational design (Hodges, 2004). 

Motivational design can help transform the worth of a course by increasing its value to
stakeholder groups. Capturing student attention is the first step in encouraging motivation,



and specific design techniques such as variety and inquiry can help maintain attention
throughout the course. Hodges points out several studies that found relevance to work or
personal goals are effective motivators for learning (2004). Establishing relevance can allow
students to see future value of course content and may increase the course worth and
motivation to excel.

Quality

“Quality” can be seen as an objective measure of the cost of doing something, for example,
types of materials used, design format, or the process. The quality of any course can be
measured through the notion of “best practice,” measurable against a process (Harvey &
Green, 1993). 

Over the last decade, Quality Matters (QM) has developed nationally-recognized standards
for online course assessment, presented through customized rubrics and trainings for higher
education, K-12 education, continuing and professional education, and educational
publishing (Quality Matters, 2013a). The higher education rubric contains 40 individual
standards organized into eight categories: course overview, learner objectives, assessment
and measurement, resources and materials, learner engagement, course technology, learner
support, and accessibility (Quality Matters, 2013a). Peer-reviewers trained in the QM
evaluation procedure use the applicable rubric to assess online courses. Quality as measured
by the QM rubric is more a production issue than an assessment of the learning experience. It
measures a course against a set of standards where quality becomes an institutional matter
defined objectively through the rubric. However, the goal of higher education is not an
assembly line process that churns out identical widgets. Rather, the goal is to educate, train,
and motivate people (Hunt, 1998). The quality of a course matters only if the course has
value and is worthwhile to students. The value and worth of a course is constantly being
reevaluated as each group of students bring their own set of needs and wants to the learning
experience. Effective design requires a level of customization and tailoring in order to
provide our students with learning opportunities that have value and worth (Ahern, 2002).

Quality Matters but…

The QM process does not measure "worth;" it was designed through research to reflect
commonly-accepted "best practices." Simply adhering to QM standards does not ensure an
instructional module is worthwhile – student engagement is vital to the worth of a course. To
illustrate, we will explore a graduate research project conducted to determine quality and
usability of a demonstration course, “Workplace Nutrition” (Youger, 2013). 

The course was evaluated by a panel of three instructional design experts. Data for this
mixed-methods study comes from two sources: a qualitative online survey and a quantitative
cogntive walk-through (Wharton, et al, 1994). The online survey is a quality assessment of
the course based on nationally-recognized QM Standards. It was created, distributed,
administered, and analyzed using Qualtrics (http://www.qualtrics.com/) online survey
software. The cogntive walk-through (Wharton, et al, 1994) was designed to assess
effectiveness and usability of the course from an expert instructional designer perspective in
real-time using a concurrent think-aloud protocol (Van Den Haak, De Jong, & Schellens.,
2003) to record their instructional design perception while completing a learning task within
the module. 

“Workplace Nutrition” was designed as an 8-week online adult continuing-education
demonstration course. The course was designed to maximize learning outcomes on
workplace nutrition and help business-oriented students move beyond merely exploring the
topic, leading them into more advanced stages of learning and application (Swan et al., 2008)
by tasking them to match course resources with known company environment and attitudes. 

Resources and assignments are designed to promote higher-order thinking skills (Churches,



2008) by building on users’ existing knowledge or experience. New concepts are presented
using a scaffold approach that builds on previous materials (Shambaugh & Magliaro, 1997).
Weekly discussions encourage an experience-sharing process designed to build a sense of
community (Akyol & Garrison, 2011). Course content and assignments, designed to allow
peer-tutoring and feedback elements, are intended to help students advance from knowledge
acquisition to knowledge application (Swan et al., 2008). The education experience
culminates in a final project that reflects overall learning achievements (Akyol & Garrison,
2011). 

Expert participants were asked to view the “Workplace Nutrition” demonstration course
using an institutional Learning Managaement System (LMS). To measure quality, the experts
were asked to access and review the syllabus and two completed learning modules within the
demonstration course and then complete the online Qualtrics survey based on nationally-
recognized QM Standards. 

The second data source, the cognitive walk-through, was designed to evaluate the usability of
the learning modules using the embedded voice recording tool within the LMS. They were
instructed to access the course syllabus, navigate and review the lessons. They were asked to
complete a brief reading in Unit 1, then navigate to the discussion section of the course to
create a brief response to an assignment question. The recording documented individual
efforts in real-time as the course was reviewed and the learning tasks completed.

Implications

The experts found the demonstration course to be of high quality, based on the requirements
of the QM rubric. However, the results of the cognitive walk-through seemed to indicate that
the course may not be of high value to learners. 

The experts were asked to rate how well the course syllabus adhered to QM guidelines.
Results showed good to excellent ratings. However, responses from the cognitive walk-
through indicated some level of dissatisfaction with the actual experience of the course.
These responses indicate a shift in perspective when the experts were experiencing the course
as a student and not as expert instructional designers. When viewed from a student
perspective, suggestions were made to create a more “valuable” syllabus, such as adding due
dates and clarification of point values. It was interesting that Expert A said the University
policies (QM Standard 1.4), typically required on all syllabi, were “there and clear,” but
admitted that “honestly, I don’t read this part as a student.” Active observation research
confirms this is a true statement for many students, who seem most interested in assignments,
due dates and point-values (R. E. Youger, personal communication, October 24, 2014)

When discussing lesson activities and course progression (QM Standard 4.1, 4.2), this same
expert stated that they had been seeking a relationship between the units, and suggested that
the course progression be provided in the syllabus. The fact that this progression relationship
was provided in the syllabus reinforced their final comment that, as a student, they skim the
syllabus quickly. This reflects one of the limitations of this study, in that experts did not have
any instructor or peer interaction that would possibly clarify these issues.

Another expert raised an interesting dilemma facing all instructional designers: learning
styles. While Expert A expressed a need for more bullet points in the course introduction,
Expert C stated they would like the introduction “in plain English format with no bullet
points,” adding they “have ADHD and need to be drawn in to focus” (Youger, 2013). Here
again, instructor input and peer interaction may alleviate some of these types of concerns, but
they raise a valid point that designers must be aware of differing learning styles when
creating modules and activities. 

In reviewing comments made during the cognitive walk-through done from a student
perspective, it became obvious that some customization and instructor/peer interaction was



needed to add value to the course and enhance the worth of the individual learning
experience. This important facet was not apparent solely from the QM-based survey.

Recommendations

Online courses can vary greatly in organizational structure and should be evaluated in each
section to best meet the needs of learners in that particular group. Courses can be designed to
run asynchronous and include learning goals that can be achieved through directed
independent readings, assessed via submitted assignments. Online courses can also be
delivered synchronously, requiring students and instructors to be online at an established
time to actively participate in course activities in real-time. While some form of standard
delivery structure may be desired, the value of the learning experience depends on many
factors that cannot be measured on a standards-based rubric, including student motivation
and socioeconomic issues. 

Motivation plays a large role in effective adult education. Student engagement can be
heightened if tasks and assignments allow them to make connections between course
resources and their existing knowledge or experience base. The new knowledge must have
some value to the student to maintain motivation. One method of ensuring the “worth” of an
online course is to build a needs-assessment phase into the instructional design process.
Assignments can be structured so students discuss each lesson in terms of personal
experience with or to the concepts. Active observation research (R. E. Youger, personal
communication, October 24, 2014) has shown students become more vested in their own
learning when they expand their knowledge of something that has value to them personally.

Socioeconomic factors can greatly impact student learning (Forsyth & Furlong, 2003).
Resources can be interpreted differently and interactions will certainly vary between each
class section. A successful learning experience requires each student to develop a connection
between the course, the content, and their reason for taking the course. QM guidelines
provide a standard, predictable format for online courses, but cannot increase the worth of a
course to students. Needs-assessment measures can alert instructors to socioeconomic factors
that can contribute greatly to a student’s success or failure in an online course. Despite the
best efforts in connectivity, for example, some students have outdated equipment and
software or intermittent online access. Financially-struggling students will place a greater
value and worth on having a properly-functioning computer and reliable internet access than
those without financial concerns, and instructors must be sensitive to these issues in order to
provide a valuable learning experience. 

Active instructor involvement is an important aspect of effective online learning (Rovai,
2002). Ongoing instructor participation is vital in creating a course that fulfills university
requirements while keeping students actively involved in the learning process. Just as
students are required to show up for a face-to-face course, they demonstrate an online
“presence” through regular participation in online learning activities. Instructors are
responsible for establishing an online classroom or community that encourages
communication and learning opportunities. Exchanges and interactions can be designed and
presented to enhance the learning process by creating a positive learning experience,
particularly through the use of motivational design techniques.

Developing and teaching online courses can be a big adjustment for many instructors (Smyth,
2014; Hunt et al., 2014). Many dislike the lack of visual interaction available in face-to-face
courses (Shea, 2007). Some have poor technical skills or are uncomfortable with technology
in general, while others lack a technical instructional design background and are unsure how
to transfer the course content online and present it so that achieves course learning goals in a
positive manner. For these instructor-designers, a standardized rubric such as that provided
by QM can serve as a guide for setting up their online course shell. Additional work and
customization of content is still necessary to create a valuable learning experience, and
instructors may become frustrated since they do much more than merely “teach.” Motivation



to produce and teach high-quality online courses can often be overshadowed by simultaneous
University need for ongoing research, conference, and publication activities. 

Finally, confidence-enhanced materials such as personalized progress reports and emails may
help increase the “value” of a course for students by recognizing their ideas and
achievements and grounding these in the structure of the course individually (Keller, 1987a,
1987b, 2010). Successful course design is an iterative process in which the notion of value is
assessed and actions are taken to make the course worthwhile while adhering to curriculum
alignment. The needs-assessment process provides a student profile that can be measured
against past course feedback to reach an aggregate notion of worth. Each course can be
refined, based on the past “success” and current “need.” Because the process should be data-
driven, it is vital that faculty learn to read and effectively use reports available in learning
management systems to remain apprised of student performance and progress, which can
lead to better design of the content, assignments, and presentation of the online course.

Conclusion

Each stakeholder audience has a different interpretation of the meaning of the words,
“quality,” “value,” and “worth” when evaluating an online course, depending on their
relationship to that course. Courses can be custom-designed to meet the needs of each target
audience when education techniques and design knowledge are used to offset factors that can
negatively impact adult learning. Motivational design attempts to make instruction more
intrinsically interesting (Keller, 2010). Regulated quality of an online course has no bearing
on student motivation - what matters is good course design, which leads to the creation of
value and worth. 

Each learning experience is a unique event centered on a designed “course” and the
perceived worth to individual students. Just as a course will change in some ways when a
new instructor takes over, the course also changes with the students in each section. The
individuals that make up each learning event have different motivators and background
knowledge; therefore, exchanges, ideas, and sense of worth will vary within class sections. 

One strategy to blend quality with value and increase potential worth of a course is to
conduct an informal evaluation of student needs in the opening week of each course section.
Instructors may notice patterns or trends that allow them to customize course resources or
presentation in order to have the greatest impact on student interests and pre-existing
knowledge. Motivational design strategies suggested by Keller can help designers capture
and hold learner attention and provide a perception of relevance, confidence and satisfaction
that increases the value and worth of learning the content. This in turn leads to enhanced
cognitive performance (Means, 1997; Keller, 1987, 2006, 2010). 

Standardization of educational courses for measurable quality can be accomplished through
the application of a rubric such as QM. However, customization is required to increase the
value and worth of a course. Instructors need to know and understand their audience. When
survey or textual needs-assessment are conducted during the first week of classes, there is a
greater chance of creating a more valuable individual learning experience. This needs-
assessment can be as informal as asking students to address specific inquiries when creating
an introduction posting for the course. By investigating the motivation behind student
enrollment, instructors can fine-tune the content, presentation, or sequencing so course and
student goals align to provide high-quality, high-value educational experiences for both
students and instructors.

Children are renowned for asking, “Why?” We don’t grow out of this curiosity as adults: our
whole lives are spent in search of the answer to this illusive question. Adult learners want to
know “why” something is important -- more specifically, why is something important to us
personally, what do we gain from learning this “thing?” That is part of our instinctive effort
to determine value and worth.
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